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Objective This paper reviews the effect of a variety of com-
munity-based interventions in preventing burns and scalds in 
children. It also highlights how clinical research can be used to 
improve public health and awareness.
Design The baseline research has already been carried out in 
the Bradford Burn Study which reviewed burn attendances to 
an inner city emergency department. The highest incidence of 
burns was in children below 10 years (36%) with 1 year olds 
being the largest group affected. Strategies have been put in 
place by community bodies to address this problem.
Interventions A number of community-based interventions 
have been initiated. These include A burns doll which can be 
used in health promotion activities and child safety is integral 
to the Health Visiting Service. A hot drinks campaign in tod-
dler groups and setting up of a Hot Drink Zones have changed 
practice. Safety leafl ets focusing on the issues of burns in chil-
dren have been produced. The information for the study has 
also been used in the Stay Safe event which has been facilitated 
by St Johns Ambulance Service. Further work in the commu-
nity including the Primary care Trust and children’s centres 
has also help spread the message.
Conclusion This poster has demonstrated that a multifaceted 
strategy to reduce burns and scalds in children can be initiated 

by community teams. It is paramount that good quality clini-
cal data can be made available so that effective change can 
occur in the fi eld of child safety.
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